From: Robert Stephenson rob@rs41.org &
Subject: Re: MH Tower financials
Date: June 18, 2022 at 10:02 AM

To: Renee Davis unionstreetkitchens@gmail.com, Brad Davis bdavisconstructionco@gmail.com
Cc: Todd Croteau tcroteau @townofjaffrey.com, Elisa FitzGerald efitzgerald @townofjaffrey.com

Hello,

I'm at a loss here. Looking at the two invoices (attached) they are the same though different dates.

The “invoice amount” is $52,470. (This same amount was previously paid. Is this a second invoice for the same

amount?)

And what’s the $49,999.99 and “Outstanding balance” of $2,470.01?

O

As | understand it a second invoice was sent to the Town. Are the attached the second invoice. I've never seen these
before. | don’t know what the amount is and | don’t know whether anyone in the Town has received it, processed it or

paid it.
I’'m mystified by all of this.

Rob
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B. DAVIS CONSTRUCTION CO. LLC

nvoice 202253
Due date June 1, 2022
Invaice amount £52.470.00
Total $49,999.99
Outstanding balance $2,470.00
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On Jun 17, 2022, at 11:59 AM, Renee Davis <unionstreetkitchens @gmail.com> wrote:

Hello Rob,

I'm working on sending you the open invoices now. | was trying to find a way to send them in a PDF style vs online,
but it doesn't look like | can do that.

So, here are the invoice 202253 and the invoice 202261 links
Thank you. Please let me know if you need anything else.

Renee Davis
Union Street Kitchens & B. Davis Construction Co. LLC
603-520-6733

On Fri, Jun 17, 2022 at 11:52 AM Bradley Davis <bdavisconstructionco@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Robert Stephenson <rob@rs41.org>

Date: Fri, Jun 17, 2022 at 11:38 AM

Subject: MH Tower financials

To: Todd Croteau <tcroteau @townofjaffrey.com>, Elisa FitzGerald <efitzgerald @townofjaffrey.com>

CC: Brad Davis <bdavisconstructionco@gmail.com>, Michael Petrovick <mpetrovick @mijparchitect.com>

Hello,
The financials on the MH Tower project have been updated and may be seen at:

http:/www.rs41.org/Meetinghouse/tower%20invoices.htm

Please have a look and let me know of any missing information or errors/omissions.
| have not received the invoice or any information on Progress Payment #2 from Davis Construction.
Regards,

Rob
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Jaffrey Meetinghouse Tower

Town of Jaffrey, New Hampshire

Jaffrey Meetinghouse Committee

Robert B. Stephenson, Member

150 Rivermead Road, Apt 243, Peterborough, NH 03458 USA

Cel Tel: +1 603-933-2471

E-mail: rob@rs41.org

Back-up e-mail: 532763 @gmail.com
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Bradley Davis Email sent via IPhone
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Cell 603-630-0848
Office 603-924-4038
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